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PENNSYLVANIA 
 
1. Pennsylvania Prison Society The Pennsylvania Prison Society is a social justice organization advocating 
on behalf of prisoners, their families, and formerly incarcerated individuals. 
 
(215) 564-4775, http://www.prisonsociety.org/, psuperville@prisonsociety.org  
 
Pennsylvania Prison Society, 245 North Broad St., Ste. 200, Philadelphia, PA 19107 
 
2. Philadelphia RISE – Reintegration Services for Ex-Offenders The Mayor’s Office of Reintegration 
Services (RISE) utilizes direct services and partnerships with other agencies to assist the formerly 
incarcerated in their reintegration back into the community. If you are a returning citizen, RISE has a 
variety of services to meet your needs. 
 
(215) 683-3370, http://rise.phila.gov/, william.hart@phila.gov  
 
Mayor’s Office of Reintegration Services, 34 S. 11th St., Philadelphia, PA 19107 
 
3. Goldring Reentry Initiative (GRI) The Goldring Reentry Initiative (GRI) was established in 2011 to 
address the growing epidemic of mass incarceration and the many barriers individuals incarcerated in the 
Philadelphia Prison System (PPS) face upon release. Because of its person-centered and holistic approach, 
the social work profession is especially well equipped to address the interwoven issues faced by individuals 
who are currently or formerly incarcerated. 
 
(215) 573-7942, http://www.sp2.upenn.edu/gri/, franken@sp2.upenn.edu   
 
University of Pennsylvania, School of Social Policy & Practice, 3815 Walnut St., Philadelphia, PA 19104 
 
4. Lancaster County Reentry Management Organization (RMO) A collaborative group of over 50 
organizations, the Lancaster County Re-Entry Management Organization (RMO) provides a way for the 
many groups that work with ex-offenders in Lancaster County to leverage their resources in a way that 
provides community alternatives to incarceration. 
 
(717) 735-0333, http://lancastercountyreentry.org, ssheely@verizon.net  
 
Lancaster County (RMO), 313 West Liberty St., Ste. 114, Lancaster, PA 17603 
 
5. Jubilee Ministries Our Mission Statement: Provide Christian discipleship to those incarcerated or in 
after-care programs who are committed to seeking reconciliation with God and establishing a personal, 
growing relationship with Jesus Christ as Savior and Lord. 
 
(717) 274-7528, http://www.jub.org, Jubilee@jub.org  
 
Jubilee Ministries, 235 S. 12th St., Lebanon, PA 17042 
 
6. Justice & Mercy Justice & Mercy is a nonprofit, volunteer organization dedicated to decreasing the 
effects of crime in our communities, increasing public safety, and ministering to and restoring both crime 
victims and offenders. 
 
 (717) 560-6980, http://www.justicemercy.org, kponchione@justicemercy.org   
 
Justice and Mercy, PO Box 5422, Lancaster, PA 17606 
 
7. Liberty Ministries Liberty Ministries was established in 1980 to serve the inmate populations of 
Montgomery County Correctional Facility and the State Correctional Institution at Graterford. Since that 
time, Liberty Ministries has positively impacted thousands of men and women inmates and ex-inmates with  
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the teaching of the Word of God, spiritual, physical and emotional support, and the life changing power of 
Jesus Christ. 
 
(610) 287-5481, http://www.libertyministries.us, ministryinfo@libertyministries.us  
 
Liberty Ministries, 565 Main Street, P.O. Box 87, Schwenksville, PA 19473 
 
8. The Parent WISE Program This program provides comprehensive services and delivers a wide array of 
family support programming in the jail and in the community with the goal of keeping families connected. 
 
(724) 837- 5410, http://www.fswp.org, CawoskiJ@FSWP.org   
 
Family Services of Western Pennsylvania, 211 Huff Ave., Greensburgh, PA 15601 
 
9. Renewal, Inc. Renewal, Inc. is "dedicated to the renewal of individuals in the criminal justice system and 
to their return to society as responsible citizens." 
 
(412) 690-2445, http://www.renewalinc.com, info@renewalinc.com  
 
Renewal, Inc., 601 Grant St., 5th Fl., Pittsburgh, PA  15219 
 
10. Lydia’s Place Lydia’s Place mission is dedicated to helping female offenders and their dependent 
children rebuild their lives and to become productive members of the community. 
 
(412) 697-0880, http://lydiasplace.org/, nwharton@renewalinc.com  
 
Lydia’s Place, Inc., 700 Fifth Ave., 4th Fl., Pittsburgh, PA 15219 
 
11. Safe Haven Re-Entry Program (SHaRP) SHaRP is a faith-based ministry committed to reaching-out 
and empowering incarcerated men, women and their family members through re-entry & life action skills 
to help reduce the recidivism pattern. 
 
(215) 763-3079, http://www.sharpphilly.org, info@sharpphilly.org  
 
SHaRP, P.O. Box 3477, Philadelphia, PA 19122 
 
12. Community Action Association of Pennsylvania (CAAP) The Community Action Association of 
Pennsylvania (CAAP) is a statewide membership organization representing 41 Community Action 
Agencies in the Commonwealth.  CAAP acts as a statewide voice for local Community Action Agencies  
 
and low-income citizens. It is the primary source of advocacy, education, technical assistance, news and 
networking for the Community Action network of Pennsylvania. 
 
(717) 233-1075, http://www.thecaap.org, dan@thecaap.org  
 
CAAP, 222 Pine St., Harrisburg, PA 17101 
 
13. Christian Recovery Aftercare Ministry Incorporated Mission Statement: To provide pre-release and re-
entry services to prisoners and ex-offenders. 
 
(717) 234-3664, http://www.craminc.org/, contact-us@craminc.org  
 
CRAM, Inc., 509 Division St., P.O. Box 5464, Harrisburg, PA 
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14. Amiracle4sure, Inc. Amiracle4sure, located in Harrisburg, PA, assists in the reentry of those negatively 
impacted by incarceration or substance abuse. Our wide variety of programs offer services to ex-offenders, 
those in recovery, and children who may have been effected. 
 
(717) 592-1153, http://www.amiracle4sure.com/, amiracle4sure@gmail.com  
 
Amiracle4sure, Inc., 1625 N. Front St., Harrisburg, PA 17102 
 
15. Firm Foundation of PA, Inc. Firm Foundation, an interdenominational community development 
Christian ministry in Harrisburg, has been instrumental in organizing Fugitive Safe Surrender. Firm 
Foundation provides numerous fathers and ex-offenders with housing. 
 
(717) 233-6133, http://www.firmfoundation.org, rtilley@firmfoundation.org  
 
Harrisburg Brethren in Christ Church, 28 N. 19th St., Harrisburg, PA 17103 
 
16. Offender Reentry Reentry planning for an offender’s return to their community begins on day one of 
incarceration. Upon admission to state prison, the PA Department of Corrections (DOC) conducts a battery 
of assessments to determine the inmate's risk of reoffending; propensity to act violently; levels of criminal 
attitudes and hostility; problems with substance abuse; and general psychological well-being. 
 
(717) 787-5699, http://www.pbpp.state.pa.us, rpodguski@pa.gov  
 
Pennsylvania Board of Probation and Parole, 1101 S. Front St., Ste. 5400, Harrisburg, PA 
 
17. Ex-Offender Re-Entry Program of Monroe County, Inc. Mission Statement: Recruit, assist and equip 
people, families and resources within Monroe County to transition those ex-offenders who want to stay out 
of prison to effectively re-enter the community. 
 
(570) 421-3280, http://ex-offender.com, info@ex-offender.com  
 
Re-Entry Program of Monroe County, Inc., P.O. Box 1251, Stroudsburg, PA 18360 
 
18. I'm FREE - Females Reentering Empowering Each Other I’m FREE – Females Reentering 
Empowering Each Other offers one-year, therapeutic residential reentry training for women that addresses 
all aspects of her life, including health, psychological state, social and family situations, vocational 
background and legal issues. 
 
(215) 951-0330, http://www.imfreeonline.org, ImFREEonline@gmail.com  
 
I'm Free, RHD – New Beginnings, 3721 Midvale Ave., Philadelphia PA 19129 
 
19. McKean County Department of Human Services It is the mission of the McKean County Department of 
Human Services to ensure that every person served by mental health, mental retardation, children and 
youth, drug and alcohol services have the opportunity for growth, recovery, and inclusion in their 
community, access to an array of services that meet their individual needs so they can enjoy a quality of life 
that includes family and friends. 
 
(814) 887-3350, http://www.mckeancountypa.org/Departments/Human_Services/Index.aspx, 
dbwolfe@mckeancountypa.org  
 
McKean County Department of Human Services, 17155 Route 6, Smethport, PA 16749 
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20. Restorative Justice The Mural Arts Program incorporates the concepts of restorative justice through art 
instruction, mural making, and community service work within the criminal justice system. Current 
inmates, probationers and parolees, and juvenile delinquents are given the opportunity to learn new skills 
and make a positive contribution to their communities to repair the prior harm they may have caused. 
 
(215) 685-0726, http://muralarts.org, robyn.buseman@muralarts.org  
 
City Of Philadelphia Mural Arts Program, 1729 Mt. Vernon Street, Philadelphia, PA  19130 
 
21. Riverside Care: West Outpatients services for Adults. SDS classes and DUI treatment. 
 
(215) 747-6480, http://www.eaglevillehospital.org, ptoth@eaglevillehospital.org  
 
Eagleville Hospital, 5501 Chestnut Street, Philadelphia, PA  19107 
 
22. New Start II At Jackson Street New Start II at Jackson Street is a long-term residential treatment facility 
that provides intensive drug and alcohol treatment and mental health support services to chronically  
homeless males. The program treatment design is an individualized level system, assisting residents in 
establishing psychosocial supports necessary for independent living 
 
(215) 537-0119, http://www.rhd.org, start@rhd.org  
 
Resources for Human Development, 5000 Jackson Street, Philadelphia, PA 19124 
 
23. People For People: Project Fresh Start This program assists ex-offenders to successfully transition back 
into Philadelphia through comprehensive mentoring services, increasing public safety and reducing 
recidivism. 
 
(215) 235-2340, http://www.peopleforpeople.org/index.html, mmiles@peopleforpeople.org  
 
People for People, Inc., 800 N. Broad Street, Philadelphia, PA 19130 
 
24. Philadelphia Ready4Work Services for 18-34 yr.-old offenders with non-violent/non-sexual 
convictions. 
 
(215) 320-5557, http://ctstraining.org, Jhorn@ctsworks.org  
 
Connection Training Services (CTS), 2243 West Allegheny Ave., Philadelphia, PA 19132 
 
25. Re-Entry One Stop Satellite Center A reentry service that provides assistance for former inmates 
regarding education, housing, paternity testing, legal services, and more. 
 
(215) 423-2944, http://www.impactservices.org, pmartino@impactservices.org  
 
Impact Services Corporation, 1952 E. Allegheny Ave., Philadelphia, PA 19134 
 
26. The Center For Returning Citizens: The Friend’s Center The Center for Returning Citizens exists to 
help persons who are returning to society to establish themselves and move forward in a positive manner. 
 
(215) 305-8793, http://tcrcphilly.org, jharrell@tcrcphilly.org  
 
The Center for Returning Citizens, 1501 Cherry Street, Philadelphia, PA  19102 
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27. X-Offenders Empowerment Helping ex-offenders (not on probation or parole) find employment and 
reintegrate in to the community, has monthly meetings at African-American United Fund. 
 
(215) 668-8477, http://x-offenders.org/, jacobs19132@yahoo.com  
 
X-Offenders for Community Empowerment, 2227 N. Broad St., Philadelphia, PA 19132 
 
28. Beginning In the Right Direction (B.I.R.D.) Ministries Providing women who have been in prison with 
the spiritual, emotional and practical support needed to rebuild their lives and overcome the cycle of drugs, 
poverty and violence that has devastated their lives and families. 
 
(717) 295-3301, http://www.birdministries.org, birdministries@comcast.net  
 
B.I.R.D. Ministries, 2086 New Danville Pike, Lancaster, PA 17603 
 
29. Courage House Inc. Provide certified recovery coaching management services, spiritual monitoring & 
re-entry programming that enhances the recovery process for those dealing with domestic violence, 
substance use issues, trauma and incarceration. 
 
(717) 624-0177, http://www.thecouragehouse.com/, thecouragehouse@live.com  
 
Courage House Inc., 6945 York Road, Ste. 2, Abbottstown, PA 17301 
 
30. GEO's York Reentry Service Center The center offers day reporting, cognitive behavioral therapy and 
employment-readiness training services with evidence-based programming designed to rehabilitate 
offenders and successfully prepare them for life after prison, while maintaining public safety. 
 
(717) 848-4448, http://www.georeentry.com/, kalen.macon@bi.com  
 
GEO Reentry Services, 1 E. Market St., Ste. 301-204, York, PA 17401 
 
31. Accelerated Support Services for Older Adults  Supportive services to persons 60 years and older that 
have been released from jail or prison and need assistance obtaining housing, food, and clothing. Services 
include counseling, job readiness, housing assistance, attending hearings, and in-home services. 
 
(412) 392-4450, http://www.hillhouse.org/, eboyd@hillhouse.org  
 
Hill House Senior Services Center, 2038 Bedford Ave., Pittsburgh, PA 15219 
 
32. Justice Related Services Helps prevent people from returning to jail by offering pre- and post-release 
services. Services in the Allegheny Count Jail include: job preparation, life skills, family support and 
relationship classes, GED preparation, Adult Basic Education, vocational education, housing preparation,  
drug and alcohol treatment, anger management, mentoring, connection with probation, and release 
planning. 
 
(412) 884-4500, http://www.hsao.info/, info@hsao.info  
 
HSAO, Inc., 2801 Custer Ave., The Hough Bldg., Ste. 1, Pittsburgh, PA 15227 
 
33. Pinebrook Family Answers   Provides youth, adult offenders and their families with opportunities to 
build healthy, productive lives. 
 
(610) 433-6556, http://www.thepwf.org/, loriv@thepwf.org  
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THE PROGRAM for Women & Families, 927 Hamilton St., Allentown, PA 18101 
 
34. Reentry Services at the Berks County Community Reentry Center Provide reentry assistance, 
information, referrals, and case management to individuals preparing them for a successful release from the 
Community Reentry Center (CRC) to the community. 
http://www.berksconnections.org/reentry-services.htm 
 
(610) 478-6920, http://www.berksconnections.org/home.htm, creichardt@countyofberks.com  
 
BCPS/Berks Connections Pretrial Services, 633 Court St., 16th Fl., Reading, PA 19601 
 
35. Allegheny County Jail Collaborative (ACJC) Provides resources and employment information to pre-
release offenders to aid their transition from prison and back into the job market. 
 
(412) 227-5021, http://ulpgh.org/, lcriego@ulpgh.org  
 
Urban League of Greater Pittsburgh, Inc., 610 Wood St., Pittsburgh, PA 15222 
 
36. Stephen's Place, Halfway House Halfway house for non-violent adult males with a history of substance 
abuse who are coming out of prison and need a safe environment where they can re-integrate into society. 
 
(610) 861-7677, http://stephens-place.org/, sister@stephen-place.com  
 
Stephen's Place, Inc., 729 Ridge St., Bethlehem, PA 18015 
 
37. Self HelpMovement Self Help Movement is a drug and alcohol inpatient treatment facility located in 
the Far Northeast section of Philadelphia. 
 
(215) 677-7778, http://selfhelpmovement.org/, shm@selfhelpmovement.org  
 
Self Help Movement, Inc., 2600 Southampton Rd., Philadelphia, PA 19116 
 
38. Baker Industries Baker Industries is a nonprofit work program for adults who are on parole or 
probation, in recovery, homeless, or have a diagnosed disability. 
 
(610) 296-9795, http://bakerindustries.org/, beth@bakerindustries.org  
 
Baker Industries, 184 Pennsylvania Ave., Malvern, PA  19355 
 
39. Ready, Willing & Able Ready, Willing & Able breaks the cycles of homelessness, addiction, and 
criminal recidivism by providing paid transitional work, occupational training, housing, and comprehensive 
support services to homeless individuals. 
 
(215) 732-3781, http://www.rwaphiladelphia.org/, mwells@doe.org  
 
Ready, Willing & Able, 1211 Bainbridge St., Philadelphia, PA 19147 
 
40. Good Shepherd Mediation Program – Restorative Justice The Good Shepherd Mediation Program 
offers four models of restorative dialogue: Community Group Conferencing, Victim-Offender 
Conferencing, Circles and Family Group Decision Making. 
 
(215) 843-5413, http://www.phillymediators.org/, sforeman@phillymediators.org  
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Good Shepherd Mediation Program (GSMP), 5356 Chew Ave., Philadelphia, PA 19138 
 
JEVS Human Services, 1845 Walnut St., 7th Fl., Philadelphia, PA 19103 
 
41. Promise Place Promise Place is a transitional living facility that provides a safe and supportive 
environment for women released to the community from prison. 
 
(717) 985-6440, http://www.theprograminc.org/, tjohnson@theprograminc.org  
 
Promise Place, CCF of The Program "It's About Change", 381 S. Second St., Steelton, PA 17113 
 
42. Womanspace East, Inc. Womanspace East, Inc. was founded and chartered in 1976 by a small group of 
women who recognized the need to provide supportive services to women who had fallen victim to 
homelessness due to a variety of crisis situations. 
 
(412) 765-2661, http://www.wseinc.org/index.php, womanspaceeast@gmail.com  
 
Womanspace East, Inc., P.O. Box 3826, Pittsburgh, PA 15230 
 
43. Divine Intervention Ministries Divine Intervention Ministries is dedicated to providing currently and 
formerly incarcerated adults and at-risk youth with coordinated resources that will connect them to 
supportive services and job training opportunities focusing on restoring and realizing their maximum 
potential spiritually, physically, and economically. 
 
(412) 621-0622, http://www.divineinterventionministries.org/, dtm1003@comcast.net  
 
Divine Intervention Ministries, 2203 Centre Ave, P.O. Box 71184, Pittsburgh, PA 15213 
 
44. Next Step Recovery Housing Next Step Recovery Housing, LLC is an organization dedicated to 
assisting and improving the lives of those suffering from addiction.  The mission of Next Step Recovery 
 
Housing, LLC is to provide residential housing, education, support, and services to people in recovery from 
addiction to drugs and alcohol. 
 
(412) 331-2887, http://www.nextstepfoundation.com/, nextstepfoundation@hotmail.com  
 
Next Step Recovery Housing, LLC, 641 Broadway Ave, 2nd Fl., McKees Rocks, PA 15136 
 
45. Alumni Ex-Offenders Association The Alumni Ex-Offenders Association (AEA) is a program of 
Reconstruction, that addresses former offenders as they come back into the community after being 
incarcerated. This programs attempts to create an atmosphere that is principled and encourages the 
members to lead productive lives. 
 
(215) 223-8180, http://www.reconstructioninc.org/, rec2ffl@aol.com  
Reconstruction, Inc., P.O. Box 7691, Philadelphia, PA 19101 
 
PENNSYLVANIA (CONT.) 
 
46. Center for Alternatives in Community Justice CACJ began in 1976 as a grass roots effort by 
community citizens to address the problems faced by offenders re-entering the community. It was 
incorporated in 1978. 
 
(814) 234-1059, http://www.cacj.us/, cacj@choiceonemail.com  
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Center for Alternatives in Community Justice (CACJ), 411 South Burrowes St., State College, PA 1680 
 
47. Community Action Agency of Delaware County (CAADC) The Community Action Agency of 
Delaware County, Inc. has been serving Delaware County’s economically disadvantaged residents for over 
thirty years. 
 
(610) 891-5101, http://www.caadc.org/, info@caadc.org  
 
CAADC, Inc., 201 West Front St., Toal Bldg., Media, PA 19063 
 
48. God’s Treasure House Ministries God’s Treasure House Ministries is a 501c3 non-profit organization 
established to provide a comprehensive aftercare program targeted to women and children from the 
community and to ex-offenders returning from prison who are victims of domestic violence. 
 
(215) 723-7499, http://www.godstreasurehouse.org/, godstreasurehouse@godstreasurehouse.org  
 
God’s Treasure House Ministries, Inc., P.O. Box 5, Schwenksville, PA 19473 
 
49. CR-SO (Community Renewal for Sex Offenders) CR-SO is a community-based volunteer organization 
providing support and encouragement for family and friends of currently incarcerated sex offenders, and 
support and encouragement for formerly incarcerated sex offenders as they seek personal renewal and 
reentry into the community. CR-SO also provides community education on sex offending and on sex 
offender issues. 
 
(610) 777-2222, http://www.newpersonministries.org/, crso@newperson.org  
 
New Person Ministries, Inc., P.O. Box 223, Reading, PA 19607 
 
50. Community Empowerment Association Community Empowerment Association is founded on the basic 
belief that families develop best in a community with a sense of order, positive social interaction, and 
opportunities supported by positive adults. 
 
(412) 371-3689, http://ceapittsburgh.org/, contact@ceapittsburgh.org  
 
CEA, 7120 Kelly St., Pittsburgh, PA 15208 
 
51. Pennsylvania Organization for Women in Early Recovery (POWER) POWER (Pennsylvania 
Organization for Women in Early Recovery) is a non-profit agency whose mission is to help women  
reclaim their lives from the disease of addiction to alcohol and other drugs, and to reduce the incidence of 
addiction in future generations. We envision a day when all women struggling with addiction will realize 
the promises of recovery. 
 
(412) 243-7535, http://www.power-recovery.com/index.html, rdavis@power-recovery.com  
 
POWER, 7501 Penn Ave., Ste. 8, Pittsburgh, PA 15208 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 9 

PENNSYLVANIA (CONT.) 
 
52. Domestic Outreach Center Domestic Outreach Center is a non-profit corporation that provides tuition 
subsidized psycho-educational services for men and women who have committed simple assault, domestic 
abuse or domestic violence. 
 
(412) 559-1197, http://domesticoutreach.com, Lshe625@comcast.net  
 
Domestic Outreach Center, 6207 Brownsville Rd., Finleyville, PA 15332 
 
53. The Aleph Institute – North East Region is a Jewish Humanitarian agency which provides programs, 
services and advocacy for prisoners, their families and formerly incarcerated. 
 
412-421-0111, www.alephne.org , receptionist@alephne.org 
 
Aleph Institute, 5804 Beacon Street, Pittsburgh, PA 15217 
 
 
 
 


