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1 Opening Doors - Breaking the cycle of crime and poverty one person at a time. Opening Doors works to 
open doors leading to a successful, productive life following incarceration. Our goal is to welcome home 
the prodical sons and daughters who have taken a wrong turn in life and now seek to come home.

(406) 205-4658, http://openingdoorsmt.org/, Communications@openingdoorsmt.org 

Opening Doors, P.O. Box 1868, Great Falls, MT 59404

2 Montana Correctional Enterprises Montana Correctional Enterprises operates six programs geared toward
enhancing offender success upon release to the community.  The Montana Department of Corrections is a 
state agency of Montana that operates state prisons and manages community- corrections programs. 

(406) 846-1320, http://cor.mt.gov/MCE/default.mcpx, scasey@mt.gov 

Montana Department of Corrections, 350 Conley Lake Rd., Deer Lodge, MT 59722

3   Helena’s Prerelease Center Helena’s Prerelease Center is a community corrections 105-bed facility 
serving adult men who must be a resident of Montana.  Our facility is designed to ease the transition of an 
offender from a correctional institution to living independently in the community.

(406) 447-3281, http://www.boydandrew.com/, atenney@boydandandrew.com 

Boyd Andrew Community Services (BACS), 805 Colleen St., Helena, MT 59601 

4 Montana Meth Project The Meth Project is a large-scale prevention program aimed at reducing Meth use 
through public service messaging, public policy, and community outreach.

(406) 721-2538, http://www.montanameth.org/, info@montanameth.org   

Montana Meth Project, P.O. Box 8944, Missoula, MT 59807

5 Programs for the Next Step (Rescue, Recover, Restore) The Montana Rescue Mission offers three 
different participation levels of programs for the men and women staying at our Shelters and the REACH-
Out program for children. The overall goal is that each of our classes and levels will help our guests with 
their next steps to achieve success in life after they leave the Mission. Each program level carries class 
credits and chore requirements for program involvement. 

(406) 259-3800, http://montanarescuemission.org/, gfournier@montanarescuemission.org 

Montana Rescue Mission, 2902 Minnesota Ave., Billings, MT 59101

6 T.E.A.M. (Teach, Encourage, Assist, and Model) Mentoring A Faith Based Reentry Program; Friendship 
With a Purpose.  Our Mission is to equip mentoring teams for ex-offenders and their families, providing 
friendships that Teach, Encourage, Assist, and Model a Christ-centered life.  Our Vision is that all ex-
offenders who evidence a sincere desire to change have access to a trained mentoring team and a church 
that provide healthy, supportive friendships, spiritual input, and assistance meeting practical needs.

(406) 656-8326, http://teammentoring.org/, contactteam@teammentoring.org 

T.E.A.M. Mentoring, P.O. Box 30642, Billings, MT 59107 
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7 Family Matters Program Family Matters is a Second Chance Act family-based offender substance abuse 
treatment program.  For an inmate, the most important relationships to grow and foster are those with 
family members or caregivers who parent their children while they are in prison.  Lack of strong, 
supportive family relationships can be a significant factor in recidivism.  

(406) 294-5090, http://www.forfamilies.org, susyp@forfamilies.org 

The Center for Children and Families, 3021 3rd Ave., N., Billings, MT 59101

8 Eastern Montana Community Mental Health Center (EMCMHC) The mission of Eastern Montana 
Community Mental Health Center is to provide quality, professional, comprehensive mental health and 
substance abuse treatment services to the citizens of Eastern Montana that respects the dignity of our 
citizens and communities.

(406) 234-1687, http://www.emcmhc.org/, jim54emcmhc@yahoo.com 

EMCMHC, 2508 Wilson St., P.O. Box 1530, Miles City, MT 59301

9 Hope for Men Our Christian Discipleship Program is a Christ-centered recovery program dealing with 
substance abuse and other life controlling problems. This six month program is composed of Bible studies, 
Overcomer’s support group, work therapy, and life skill classes. 

(406) 761-2653, http://greatfallsrescuemission.com/, Viki.cherewatenko@gfrm.org 

Great Falls Rescue Mission, 311 2nd Ave., S., P.O. Box 129, Great Falls, MT 59403

10 ACLU of Montana Our mission is to defend, preserve, and advance civil liberties.  Our vision for the 
future embraces the equal enjoyment of civil liberties and civil rights for all Montanans.

(406) 443- 8590, http://www.aclumontana.org/, aclu@aclumontana.org 

ACLU of Montana, P.O. Box 1317, Helena, MT 59624

11 Northwest Counseling Associates We have provided quality-counseling care and faith-based counseling 
since 1975.  Our goal has always been to provide care tailored to meet the specific needs of our clients. We 
respect all aspects of human growth and healing psychologically, physical, spiritually and culturally.  As a 
group of specialists, we can offer you professional expertise gained by many years of experience in 
diagnosing and treating problems related to adults, children, adolescents, couples or families.

(406) 259-6161, http://nwcc-mt.com, contact@nwcc-mt.com 

Northwest Counseling Associates, 1597 Ave. D, Ste. 7, Billings, MT 59102

12 Montana State Federal Bonding Program The Federal Bonding Program is an innovative activity that 
serves as a tool to secure the job placement of ex-offenders and other high-risk applicants. The program, 
sponsored by the U.S. Department of Labor, issues Fidelity bonds.  The Federal Bonding Program provides
fidelity bonding insurance coverage to individuals with criminal histories and other high-risk job applicants
who are qualified, but fail to get jobs because regular commercial bonding is denied due to their 
backgrounds.

(406) 444-7895, http://wsd.dli.mt.gov/, Jbetz@mt.gov 

Montana Department of Labor and Industry-Workforce Services Division, P.O. Box 1728, Helena, MT 
59624 
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13 Great Falls Weed& Seed Transition Coalition The Transition Coalition was created by the former Great 
Falls Weed and Seed, to address the barriers that ex-offenders have re-entering society after incarceration. 
The Coalition is made up of community advocates that identify and reduce potential barriers of to re-entry. 
Different government and non-profit agencies have come together to offer resources and share their 
knowledge about significant issues.

(406) 761-5861, http://www.gfweedandseed.org/, cbronson@nwgf.org 

NeighborWorks Great Falls, 509 1st Ave., S., Great Falls, MT 59401 

14 The Parenting Place: Support for Families Touched by Incarceration We offer programs in The 
Missoula Pre-Release Center and the Missoula County Detention Facility. During our ten-week session, 
incarcerated parents are given the opportunity to explore their own childhoods and consider how those 
early experiences in life have affected the choices they’ve made and the consequences for those choices.

(406) 728-5437, http://www.parentingplace.net/, teresa@parentingplace.net 

The Parenting Place, 1644 S. 8th St., W., Missoula, MT 59801
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